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Recently, the food additive aspartame has been affected by market 
demand, and the market transaction price is around USD 9.5-10/KG. It 
is expected that the price will remain stable in the future.

FOOD ADDITIVE

Reported by Shea & Livia & Lexie&Oliva&Hannah
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Doxycycline hydrochloride: The mainstream factories still stopped 
reporting this week, and the current market price is USD43-43.8/KG. 
The current market inventory is limited and the market is reluctant to 
sell. The market is hot and is expected to remain strong in the future. 
Please pay attention.
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Shouguang Golden Corn Biotechnology Co., Ltd. proposed a project to 
produce 200,000 tons of lysine annually: the project utilizes part of the 
original workshops, builds a new workshop with a construction area of 
​​approximately 16,600 square meters, and purchases fermentation 
tanks, fluidized beds, evaporators and other production and supporting 
equipment.
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Driven by the price increase of some vitamin products and the fact that 
calcium pantothenate is at an extremely low level and its price is on the 
edge of the industry's loss line (some companies are already making 
losses), market attention has begun to increase since this week, and 
downstream customers have increased their precautions and inventory 
reserves for calcium pantothenate products; as of now, some 
manufacturers have begun to stop signing orders or limit the number of 
orders signed.
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